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USP

Sodium Bisulfite ab Gallons no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $3.15 no bid $2.13 no bid no bid

Sodium Hypochlorite 

Minimum 10.5%

 +/- 0.5% abf Gallons $2.38 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $2.05 no bid $2.19 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $3.55

Polymer CAT FLOC TL 

(TC431T) cf

55 Gal,

Drum no bid no bid no bid

cedar floc 

526/450  

.97 per lb no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Liquid Alum f

Dry 

Tons no bid $505.00 no bid no bid no bid $535.00 no bid $383.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $402.17

Potassium 

Permanganate 

(KMNO4)F Pail $295.99 no bid no bid no bid $147.70 no bid no bid no bid $261.25 no bid no bid no bid $189.75 no bid no bid

3.14 lb  

172.70/pl

Phosphate 50/50 CEF

Ortho/Poly Blend Per  

(Poly 

Diallyldimethlammoniu

m) (PD)

Tote 

275 Gal no bid no bid $4,396.57 no bid $4,469.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $4,117.34 no bid $2,836.6305 no bid

Hydrofluosilicic Acid 

23% Bulk af Dry Ton $2,752.10 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $700.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $500.00

Bidders

Chemical Description Unit

Bid 22-17 Annual Treatment Chemicals

Tuesday, August 23, 2022 at 2:00 pm


