

RESOLUTION NO. 20-89

A Resolution to Award Bid 22-17, Annual Chemicals

WHEREAS, bids for Bid 22-17, Annual Treatment Chemicals were opened and read aloud by the City Clerk on Tuesday, August 23, 2022, and have been reviewed by the undersigned; and

WHEREAS, Exhibit A lists the bids received by multiple companies; and

WHEREAS, it is recommended that said bid be awarded to the companies that are highlighted in green in Exhibit A;

WHEREAS, it is also recommended the bids for Sodium Hypochlorite and Phosphate 50/50 be rejected as non-responsible as they do not meet the specifications of the bid and allow the purchasing agent to negotiate new terms; and


WHEREAS, funding for said bid is included in the FY 2023 Budget; and


NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that Bid 22-17, Annual Chemicals be awarded to multiple companies that are highlighted in Exhibit A.


FURTHER IT BE RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City of Alexander City, Alabama, be and hereby authorizes the Mayor to execute any and all documents pertaining to said bid and the Purchasing Agent can begin negotiations for the above stated chemicals.

ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 12th day of September 2022.

ATTEST:


Amanda F. Thomas, City Clerk


Audrey "Buffy" Colvin, Council President


Curtis "Woody" Baird, Mayor

Resolution: 20-89

CERTIFICATION OF CITY CLERK

The undersigned, as City Clerk of the City of Alexander City, Alabama, hereby certifies that the foregoing is a true, correct and complete copy of **Resolution No. 20-89** which was adopted by the City Council on this 12th day of September 2022.

WITNESS MY SIGNATURE, as City Clerk of the City Alexander City, Alabama, under the seal thereof, this 12th day of September 2022.



SEAL

Amanda F. Thomas
City Clerk of the
City of Alexander City, Alabama

Yeas: Tapley, Colvin, Hardy, E. Brown, C. Brown, Keel

Nays: none

Exhibit A for Resolution 20-89

Bid 21-07 Annual Chemicals Bid, Tuesday, August 23, 2022 at 2:00 PM, Municipal Complex Council Chambers

Chemical Description	Unit	Bidders																Price Per Load
		Brenntag Midsouth Inc	C & S Chemicals	Carus Chemicals	Cedar Chem LLC	Chemrite, Inc.	Chemtrade Chemicals	The Dycho Company Inc	G20 Tech, LLC	Harcros Chemical	Penco Inc	Polydyne Inc	PVS Chemicals Inc	Shannon Chemical	Southern Ionics Inc	Sterling Water	Univar Solutions	
Sodium Bisulfite	Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.15	NO BID	\$2.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$9,372
Sodium Hypochlorite	Gallons	\$2.38	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.05	NO BID	\$2.19	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.55	\$9,225
Polymer CAT FLOC TL (TC43IOT)		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	.97/LB	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$436.50/Drum
Liquid Alum Potassium	DT	NO BID	\$505.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$535.00	NO BID	\$383.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$402.17	\$8,043.40
Permanganate (KMNO4)	PAIL	\$295.99	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$147.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$261.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$189.75	NO BID	NO BID	\$172.70	\$5,317.20
Phosphate 50/50 Ortho/Poly Blend Per (Poly Diallyldimethylammonium) (PD)	TOTE 275 GAL	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,396.57	NO BID	\$4,469.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,117.34	NO BID	\$2,836.63	NO BID	11346.52/4Totes
Hydrofluosilicic Acid 23% Bulk	DT	\$2,752.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$500.00	\$2,500

Low Bid **Items to be Negotiated**

	Est. Annual Loads	Est Annual Price
Sodium Bisulfite	13	\$121,836.00
Sodium Hypochlorite	26	\$239,850.00
Polymer CAT FLOC TL (TC43IOT)	4	\$1,746.00
Liquid Alum Potassium	26	\$209,148.40
Permanganate (KMNO4)	1	\$5,317.20
Phosphate 50/50 Ortho/Poly Blend Per (Poly Diallyldimethylammonium) (PD)	24 Totes	\$68,079.12
Hydrofluosilicic Acid 23% Bulk	5	\$2,500.00
Grand Total		\$648,476.72

Curtis "Woody" Baird
Mayor
Amanda F. Thomas
City Clerk
Romy Stamps
Finance Director



CITY COUNCIL
Audrey "Buffy" Colvin
Council President
Scott Hardy
President Pro Tempore
Bobby L. Tapley
John Eric Brown
Chris Brown
Jimmy Keel

P.O. Box 552 • Alexander City • Alabama 35011-0552 • (256) 329-6700
www.alexandercityal.gov

September 8th, 2022

Subject: Bid 22-17, Award Annual Chemicals Bid

Bid 22-17, for the purchase of water treatment chemicals for use by the Alexander City Water Services was opened and read aloud by the city clerk's office on August 23rd, 2022. Hereby recommend the bid be awarded as indicated on the attached bid tabulation form.

Further request that the bids for Sodium Hypochlorite and Phosphate 50/50 be rejected as non-responsible as they do not meet the terms outlined in the bid, and hereby grant the purchasing agent permission to negotiate new contract terms.

Further request the Mayor be authorized to sign any contracts or agreements as part of this bid.

Miles Hamlett
Purchasing Agent
City of Alexander City